
The Secret Life Of Hollywood In Rome
Hollywood's relationship with Rome is a long and storied one. From the
early days of the film industry, when Italian studios were used to shoot
some of the first Hollywood films, to the present day, when Rome is a
popular filming location for major Hollywood productions. In between, there
have been countless stories of Hollywood stars living and working in Rome,
often leading to scandalous affairs and even marriages.

One of the most famous Hollywood stars to live in Rome was Audrey
Hepburn. Hepburn moved to Rome in the early 1950s, after she was cast in
the film Roman Holiday. She quickly fell in love with the city, and she lived
there for the rest of her life. Hepburn was married twice in Rome, first to
actor Mel Ferrer and then to psychiatrist Andrea Dotti. She had two sons,
Sean and Luca, with Dotti.
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Another famous Hollywood star who lived in Rome was Elizabeth Taylor.
Taylor first visited Rome in the early 1950s, when she was filming the
movie Cleopatra. She fell in love with the city, and she bought a villa in
Rome in the early 1960s. Taylor was married seven times, and two of her
marriages took place in Rome. She was married to actor Richard Burton in
Rome in 1964, and she was married to actor Eddie Fisher in Rome in 1959.

In addition to Audrey Hepburn and Elizabeth Taylor, many other Hollywood
stars have lived in Rome over the years. These include Ava Gardner,
Grace Kelly, Sophia Loren, Marcello Mastroianni, and Robert De Niro.
Rome has also been the setting for many famous Hollywood films,
including Roman Holiday, Cleopatra, La Dolce Vita, and The Godfather.

The relationship between Hollywood and Rome is a complex one. It is a
relationship that has been marked by both scandal and glamour. However,
it is a relationship that has also produced some of the most iconic films in
history.

Scandals and affairs

The Hollywood stars who have lived in Rome have often been involved in
scandalous affairs. One of the most famous scandals was the affair
between Audrey Hepburn and Mel Ferrer. Hepburn and Ferrer were
married in 1954, but they had an affair with each other while they were both
married to other people. The affair lasted for several years, and it
eventually led to Hepburn divorcing her first husband and marrying Ferrer.

Another famous scandal was the affair between Elizabeth Taylor and
Richard Burton. Taylor and Burton were married in 1964, but they had an
affair with each other while they were both married to other people. The



affair lasted for several years, and it eventually led to Taylor divorcing her
first husband and marrying Burton. Taylor and Burton were married twice,
and they divorced twice. They finally divorced for good in 1974.

In addition to these two famous scandals, there have been many other
affairs and scandals involving Hollywood stars in Rome. These include the
affair between Ava Gardner and Frank Sinatra, the affair between Grace
Kelly and Cary Grant, and the affair between Sophia Loren and Carlo Ponti.

Marriages

In addition to scandals and affairs, there have also been many marriages
between Hollywood stars in Rome. One of the most famous marriages was
the marriage between Audrey Hepburn and Mel Ferrer. Hepburn and Ferrer
were married in 1954, and they had one son together. They divorced in
1968.

Another famous marriage was the marriage between Elizabeth Taylor and
Richard Burton. Taylor and Burton were married in 1964, and they had one
daughter together. They divorced in 1974, but they remarried in 1975. They
divorced again in 1976.

In addition to these two famous marriages, there have been many other
marriages between Hollywood stars in Rome. These include the marriage
between Ava Gardner and Frank Sinatra, the marriage between Grace
Kelly and Prince Rainier of Monaco, and the marriage between Sophia
Loren and Carlo Ponti.

The relationship between Hollywood and Rome is a long and storied one. It
is a relationship that has been marked by both scandal and glamour.



However, it is a relationship that has also produced some of the most iconic
films in history.

Rome is a city that has always been attractive to Hollywood stars. It is a
city with a rich history and culture, and it is a city that is full of beauty and
romance. It is no wonder that so many Hollywood stars have chosen to
make Rome their home.
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